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  Agency 
 

  1 

 

Auglaize County Board of Developmental 
Disabilities 
 

Address: 

20 East First Street 

New Bremen, OH 45869 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)629-2419 

 

Website: 

www.auglaizeindustries.com 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Child and adult programs for developmentally delayed individuals, infant stimulation classes, 
adult training and work programs, job placement, case management and advocacy, family 
support. 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  
  2 

Auglaize County Council on Aging/Mercy Unlimited 
 

Address: 

610 Indiana Avenue 

St Marys, OH 45885 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)394-8252 

(866)244-6401 

 

Website: 

www.auglaizeseniorservices.com 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

The Auglaize County Council on Aging, Inc.’s first mission is to assist the elderly, age 60+ of 
Auglaize County by providing direct services to promote the health, emotional, social and 
intellectual well-being of senior adults; by remaining independent an 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  3 

Auglaize County Women, Infants and Children 
(WIC) 
 

Address: 

214 South Wagner Avenue 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)738-3410 

 

Website: 

www.auglaizehealth.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Program for pregnant, breastfeeding & postpartum women; infants and children to age five, 
Nutrition counseling & coupons for nutritional assistance, breastfeeding assistance, and peer 
helper program for pregnant women 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  4 

Big Brothers/ Big Sisters 
 

Address: 

204 East Spring Street 

PO Box 304 

St. Marys, OH 45885 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)394-2990 

 

Website: 

www.bbbsma.com 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

One to one program – matching a little brother or little sister with an adult volunteer, Big 
Buddy/ Little Buddy Program school mentoring – High School students are matched with 
elementary students 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  5 

Child Support Enforcement 
 

Address: 

Department of Job and Family Services 

12 North Wood Street 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)739-6510 

 

Website: 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Federal, state, and local effort to collect child support from parents who are legally obligated to 
pay, established paternity, locate absent parents, establish, modify, and enforce child and 
medical support, wage withholding orders, tax offset program, l 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  6 

Children’s Services Agency 
 

Address: 

Department of Job and Family Services 

12 North Wood Street 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)738-4311 

 

Website: 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  7 

Council on Rural Service (Piqua office) 
 

Address: 

201 RM Davis Parkway 

Suite B 

Piqua, OH 45356 

 

Phone Number: 

(937)778-5220 

 

Website: 

www.councilonruralservices.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Comprehensive education and support services to individuals and families. Programs are 
offered in nine counties in west-central Ohio: Auglaize, Champaign, Darke, Greene, Logan, 
Miami, Preble, Shelby and Van Wert. 

 

 

 



  Agency 
  Family Support 

 
  8 

Crisis Center, Inc. 
 

Address: 

2 North Wood Street 

PO Box 328 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)738-5511 

 

Website: 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

24 hour crisis intervention, safe confidential shelter, food, transportation, case management, 
legal advocacy, family crisis management and programs of prevention and intervention. 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  9 

Family and Children First 
 

Address: 

1045 Dearbaugh Avenue 

Suite 2 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)738-3355 

 

Website: 

www.fcf.ohio.gov/ContactUs/LocalFCFAuglaize.aspx 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Ohio Family and Children First (OFCF) is a partnership of state and local government, 
communities and families that enhances the well-being of Ohio’s children and families by 
building community capacity, coordinating systems and services, and engaging fam 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  10 

Health Department 
 

Address: 

214 South Wagner Avenue 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)738-3410 

 

Website: 

www.auglaizehealth.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Immunization clinic by appointment only, lead & hemoglobin testing, vision/hearing, car seat 
safety program, emergency response plan, saving minutes, medical reserve corp, tuberculosis 
skin tests, blood pressure screens, pregnancy tests, Bureau of Childre 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  11 

Help Me Grow 
 

Address: 

214 South Wagner Avenue 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)738-3410 

(800)531-6134 

 

Website: 

caxe@auglaizehealth.org   www.helpmegrow.ohio.gov 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Pregnant women, children birth to three, coordination of services, home visits, tracking, family 
plans, educational program materials, individual family service plans, development evaluation 
& identification of needs, early intervention services & referra 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  12 

Job & Family Services 
 

Address: 

12 North Wood Street 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)739-6505 

 

Website: 

www2.auglaizecounty.org/resources/jobs-family-services 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Health Start/Medicaid, family and children services, cash assistance program, food assistance 
program, emergency assistance, adoption and foster care, workforce development, child abuse 
and neglect, adult series, and child care services 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

13 
 

Juvenile Probation Office 
 

Address: 

201 South Willipie Street 

Suite 102 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)739-6776 

(419)739-6777 

 

Website: 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

The Juvenile Probation Department deals with and supervises all children placed on probation 
to their parents or the Department. 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

14 
 

Red Cross 
 

Address: 

PO Box 116 

Celina, OH 45828 

 

Phone Number: 

(567)825-3349 

 

Website: 

www.redcross.org/BillSteinbrunner 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Disaster Relief, Babysitting Classes, First Aid, Aquatic Supervision, Child Abuse Prevention 
Classes, Blood Donor Drives and Supervision, Volunteer Training and Support, Training in Adult, 
Child, & Infant CPR 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

15 
 

United Way of Auglaize County 
 

Address: 

30 East Auglaize Street 

PO Box 18 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)739-7717 

 

Website: 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

16 
 

Victim Assistance Program 
 

Address: 

Auglaize County Court House 

PO Box 1992 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)739-6795 

(419)738-2147 after 4:30 P.M. 

 

Website: 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Services for: victims of felony crimes, court support, restitution to victims 

 

 

 



  Agency 
 

 
  17 

We Care Center 
 

Address: 

720 Armstrong Street 

St Marys, OH 45885 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)394-7451 

(800)523-3978 

 

Website: 

www.wecarepeople.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Diagnostic assessment, counseling – individual and group, Case management – individual and 
group, Skills Building/Problem solving groups, Psychiatric services/medication management, 
Crisis Intervention Services, hospitalization screening, intensive home b 

 

 

 



  Early Childhood 
 

18 
 

Head Start 
 

Address: 

1045 Dearbaugh Avenue 

Suite 4 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)739-3964 

 

Website: 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Individualized teaching including special education services, school readiness goals for all 
children, use of technology in classrooms, cognitive and health screenings, family involvement 
and support 

 

 

 



  Employment 
 

 
  19 

Capabilities 
 

Address: 

124 South Front Street 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)394-0003 

 

Website: 

www.capabilitiesinc.biz 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Capabilities, Inc. offers the following vocational services provided through collaboration and 
referrals from Opportunities for Ohioans with Disabilities (formerly RSC):Transition summer 
youth services, Project Search job coaching and job search, vocation 

 

 

 



  Employment 
 

 
  20 

One Stop Employment & Training Network 
 

Address: 

801 Middle Street 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)739-7225 

 

Website: 

omjarea8.com 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Ohio has local OhioMeansJobs Centers that assist job seekers, employers and youth with job 
search assistance, employee recruitment, job training, and more. 

 

 

 



  Employment 
 

 
  21 

Workforce Investment Act (WIA) 
 

Address: 

12 North Wood Street 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)739-6505 

 

Website: 

auglaize.omjarea8.com 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Adult/Dislocated worker/youth programs, job search assistance, resume preparation, labor 
market information, career counseling/assessments, case management, occupational skills 
training, employer based training 

 

 

 



  Hospitals/Medical Facilities 
 

 
  22 

Grand Lake Health System 
 

Address: 

200 Saint Clair Street 

St Marys, OH 45885 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)394-3335 

 

Website: 

www.grandlakehealth.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Cardiology, Cardiopulmonary Rehab, Occupational Health, Occupational Health, Eye Surgery, 
plastic surgery, orthopedic surgery, Family and general practice, home health neighborhood 
nurse program, medical/surgical/emergency services, neonatology, obstetric 

 

 

 



  Recreation & Leisure 
 

 
  23 

Riverside Arts Center 
 

Address: 

3 West Auglaize Street 

PO Box 37 

Wapakoneta, OH 45895 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)738-2352 

 

Website: 

www.riversideartcenter.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

 

 

 



  Recreation & Leisure 
 

 
  24 

YMCA North Branch 
 

Address: 

7590 State Route 703 

Celina, OH 45822 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)586-9622 

 

Website: 

www.amymca.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Childcare for infants thru School Age, variety of family, programming, school age activities and 
camp opportunities, financial sponsorship available 

 

 

 



  Recreation & Leisure 
 

  25 
 

YMCA South Branch 
 

Address: 

04075 Wuebker Rd. 

Minster, OH 45846 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)629-9622 

 

Website: 

www.amymca.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Childcare for infants thru School Age, variety of family, programming, school age activities and 
camp opportunities, financial sponsorship available 

 

 

 



  Agency 
  Agency 

26 
 

Big Brothers Big Sisters of Springfield - Madison, 
Champaign and Clark Counties 
 

Address: 

625 Burt Street 

Springfield, OH 45503 

 

Phone Number: 

(937)390-9900 

 

Website: 

lshaffer@bbbscentralohio.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Big Brothers Big Sisters of Springfield serves children in Madison, Champaign and Clark Counties 
through our one-to-one Community-based Mentoring program. The agency has also partnered 
with Springfield City Schools and the Springfield Rotary Club to provi 

 

 

 

 

  



Statewide  Agency 
  Support Group 

27 
 

Brain Injury Association of Ohio 
 

Address: 

P.O. Box 21325 

Columbus, OH 0 

 

Phone Number: 

(800)444-6443 

 

Website: 

www.biausa.org/ohio 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

An advocacy and education organization designed to improve services and support to Ohioans 
with brain injury and promote prevention. 

 

 

 



Statewide  Agency 
 

  28 
 

Ohio Consumers Council 
 

Address: 

10 West Broad Street 

Suite 1800 

Columbus, OH 43215 

 

Phone Number: 

(877)742-5622 

 

Website: 

www.occ.ohio.gov 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

Answer questions regarding electricity, gas, water and phone 

 

 

 



Statewide  Family Support 
 

29 
 

Ohio Coalition for the Education of Children with 
Disabilities 
 

Address: 

165 West Center Street 

Suite 302 

Marion, OH 43302 

 

Phone Number: 

(800)374-2806 

 

Website: 

www.ocecd.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

The Ohio Coalition for the Education of Children with Disabilities (OCECD) is a statewide 
nonprofit organization that serves families of infants, toddlers, children and youth with 
disabilities in Ohio, educators and agencies who provide services to them. 

 

 

 



Statewide  Family Support 
 

30 
 

Perinatal Outreach & Encouragement (POEM) 
 

Address: 

 

 

Phone Number: 

(419)360-0169 

 

Website: 

www.poemonline.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

We are Ohio moms who have survived prenatal/postpartum depression (PPD) or anxiety so we 
understand like no one else can. We had thoughts that scared and shamed us. We blamed 
ourselves. We doubted ourselves. We felt weighed down by all the “shoulds” of mo 

 

 

 



Statewide  Hospitals/Medical Facilities 
 

31 
 

Cincinnati Children’s Hospital 
 

Address: 

3333 Burnet Avenue 

Cincinnati, OH 45229 

 

Phone Number: 

(513)636-4200 

 

Website: 

www.cincinnatichildrens.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

 

 

 



Statewide  Hospitals/Medical Facilities 
 

32 
 

Dayton Children’s Hospital 
 

Address: 

One Children’s Plaza 

Dayton, OH 45405 

 

Phone Number: 

(937)641-3000 

 

Website: 

www.childrensdayton.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

 

 

 



Statewide  Hospitals/Medical Facilities 
 

33 
 

Nationwide Children’s Hospital 
 

Address: 

700 Children’s Drive 

Columbus, OH 43205 

 

Phone Number: 

(614)722-2000 

 

Website: 

www.nationwidechildrens.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

 

 

 



Statewide  Recreation & Leisure 
 

34 
 

Special Olympics Ohio 
 

Address: 

3303 Winchester Pike 

Columbus, OH 43232 

 

Phone Number: 

(614)239-7050 

 

Website: 

www.sooh.org 

 

Hours of Operation: 

 

Services Offered: 

 

 

 

 

 


